From: Daphne Wallace -
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Cc: Richard Kahn <} | |
Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 13 Sep 2016 20:03:48 +0000

Greetings Sir,

The check for the amount of $8,000 was processed, signed by Jeanne and picked up by John Woods this
afternoon as per your instructions.

Respectfully, Daphne

On Tue, Sep 13, 2016 at 12:04 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™ wrote:
Rich pkease pay john overdue invoice assp
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