From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: Lvjet <N
Subject: Re: Privileged and Confidential - BBJ
Date: Fri, 26 Aug 2016 14:44:02 +0000

sign and send

On Fri, Aug 26, 2016 at 10:30 AM, Lvijet <] G- vrote:
Jeffrey
| didn't receive an approval to sign this LOI,
should | standby or sign and send to Claire?
(reminder the B727 requires #3 engine repair and C check to make airworthy).

thix,
Larry

————— Original Message-—-

From: Darren Indyke <} G-

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>; Larry Visoski <[ | | | -
Sent: Thu, Aug 25, 2016 6:09 pm

Subject: Privileged and Confidential - BEJ

Please see the aftached LOI for Larry’s and JEE's approval:

. Purchase Price $17MM, plus the 727

. 31MM Deposit 2 business days after Seller's acceptance of LOI

. Cash balance at closing and delivery of 727 at closing

. AIC Title is the Escrow Agent

. Subject to execution of definitive purchase agreement. Purchaser to provide first draft within 10 business days after
Ol acceptance. parties to sign within 15 days after LOl acceptance (unless extended by mutual agreement)

BBJ and 727 each fo be delivered with good title and each to be delivered in Airworthy Condition

BBJ and 727 each also to be delivered in accordance with the “Delivery Condition” to be specified in the purchase
agreement

8. BBJ to be delivered with an Export Cert of Airworthiness from UAE GCAA to the US.

9. Transaction is subject to Seller's discretionary satisfaction with pre-purchase inspection of 727

10. Transaction is subject to Purchaser's discretionary satisfaction with pre-purchase inspection of BBJ

11. If either rejects, deal terminates and money is refunded to Purchaser

12. If both accept subject to correction of discrepancies deal moves forward, but if Seller fails to correct Aircraft
Discrepancies of $500K or less or Purchaser fails to correct 727 Discrepancies of 5500K or less, then the party who fails
to correct, bears the other party's inspection costs.

13. Awugust 31 set as acceptance deadline.
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Jeffrey, if ok, please email Larry and me. Larry, once JE oks, please sign and send to Claire. Thanks.

DARREMN K. INDYKE

DARREMN K. INDYKE, PLLC
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, New York 10022
Telephone:
Telecopier:
Mobile:
email:
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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