From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=

To: Ann Rodriquez < -

Subject: Re: Great Wall completion
Date: Mon, 22 Aug 2016 21:20:08 +0000

150/420  pay him 3k total owed 12 .5 .

On Mon, Aug 22,2016 at 5:05 PM. Ann Rodriquez &_ wrote:

Hey Bossman,

[ only gave him $2k on Friday instead of 10k just in case you weren't satisfied. Would you like to give Mr.

Malbranche $4k instead of the $8k balance at the office?
$35,000.00 Bid / $10,500.00 paid to date.

420ft. Great Wall of LSJ
150ft. Completed
270ft. Incomplete

Please advise,

Ann R
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