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lication Confirmation

e

Dear [ IEEG————

Thank you for your application to the _! Please find your application confirmation and invoice below, as well as the Credit

Card Authorization Form and the wire transfer Information. Please proceed to make your deposit payment of 3500 as soon as possible. I you have

already made vour payment, thank you. If you have any questions or concerns, feel free to contact vour Admissions Representative.

Thank you,

Admissions Office

On Mon, Aug 15, 2016 at 4:30 PM, Lesley Gmﬂ"f_'-'-* wrote:

oops...there 1s nothing here (7)

On Aug 15, 2016, at 6:29 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> wrote:

please note
The information contained in this communication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation( gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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