
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
Cc: ann rodriquez 

Subject: RO LSJ - TSG 
Date: Tue, 09 Aug 2016 20:45:52 +0000 

as i mentioned yesterday Bob is playing games with us 
i am holding back getting vicious with him as that will do us no good 
i will try to source through dave at reefco or potentially another vendor 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Bob Petersen 
Subject: RO plant parts 
Date: August 9, 2016 at 4:03:54 PM EDT 
To: ann rodriquez < M>, Richard Kahn < 

I have found out we have some payment issues with our current vendor and have to clear them up before we 
can order. Still estimate 2-3 weeks after we place the order. 
We are looking for alternate suppliers and will know more tomorrow. 
If you wish us to return the wire, we will be glad to do so. 
My apologies and thank you for your patience. 

Get Outlook for iOS 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: LSJ 
Date: August 9, 2016 at 11:50:42 AM EDT 
To: Bob Petersen < 
Cc: ann rodriquez < 

can you please update us on timing of parts shipping to LSJ 
thank you 

EFTA00821778



Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: any update on timing to receive part and when you can visit LSJ? thank you 
Date: August 5, 2016 at 12:01:18 PM EDT 
To: Bob Petersen < 
Cc: Rich Murrill < >, ann rodri uez >, John Leet

>, Kelli Gatti < 

can you please call anna or i immediately 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 4, 2016, at 8:12 PM, Bob Petersen < > wrote: 

Rich 
Parts are made in Midwest in 2 different locations, as best as I can ascertain. 
With payment, we can proceed. 
Once parts are in USVI , we can schedule site visit. 

Get Outlook for iOS 

On Thu, Aug 4, 2016 at 5:27 PM -0400, "Richard Kahn" < wrote: 

you were going to find out where part was made and how soon we can have it 
when can someone visit LSJ to review our equipment? 

please advise 

EFTA00821779



thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

> On Aug 4, 2016, at 5:26 PM, Bob Petersen wrote: 

> Richard, 
> I have advised Anna that we will move forward as soon as payment is made. 

> Bob Petersen 
> General Manager 
> TSG Water Resources, USVI Inc. 

> -----Original Message--
> From: Richard Kahn [mailto 
> Sent: Thursday, August 4, 2016 1:47 PM 
> To: Bob Petersen 
> Cc: ann rodriquez 
> Subject: any update on timing to receive part and when you can visit LSJ? thank you 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
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