
From: Richard Kahn 

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: ann rodriquez 

Subject: Fwd: Chris: no work today 

Date: Fri, 27 Apr 2018 13:28:52 +0000 

Attachments: Chris_Sheehan_Summary_of Costs_of 4.19.2018_Trip.pdf 

chris has been nothing but trouble and i am pretty sure it has all been fueled by danny 
he now believes he is owed another $425 yet based on schedule below he has only worked 4 full days and wants 
to be paid for 10 days.. 

a) first is was his pay 

250 per day became 350 per day + 75 per day for dog walker 
(75 per day for dog walker is about 2.5-3.0x what it should cost... 
chris daily cost now 425 per day 

b) then days worked 

he flew down on thursday april 19th and goes home saturday april 28th 

thursday april 19th - travel day billed us for full day 
friday april 20th - met with you and worked full day 
saturday april 21st - did not work but insists on being paid 
sunday april 22nd - did not work but insists on being paid 
monday april 23rd - worked 7am - 12:00pm then refused to work at sat at bar with danny all afternoon 
tuesday april 24th - worked full day 
wednesday april 25th - worked full day 
thursday april 26th - asked for 11:30am boat to LSJ as he told anna he had to do laundry 
friday april 27th - refuses to work as he says it is a local holiday 
saturday april 28th - travel day back to FL 

Note - I was told even when on LSJ he is barely doing any work just directing men.. 

c) attached is summary of his costs for this trip and is now insisting more money ($425).. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA00822026



Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez c 
Subject: Chris: no work today 
Date: April 27, 2018 at 8:53:33 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn ca 
Chris said it's a holiday today so no work 

Ann R. 
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