
From: Ann Rodriquez • 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: Great Wall of LSJ: Mr. Anthoniel Malbranche 
Date: Mon, 01 Aug 2016 22:27:50 +0000 

Ok 

Ann R. 

On Aug 1, 2016, at 6:26 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

2k per section 

On Mon, Aug 1, 2016 at 6:24 PM, Ann Rodriquez ce wrote: 
Right now it's 15 sections and the bid is for $35k. How much would you like to offer him per section? 

Ann R. 

On Aug I, 2016, at 6:19 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

He gets paid by the section . That's it 

On Monday, 1 August 2016, Ann Rodriquez < > wrote: 
Hey Bossman, 

Mr. Malbranche now have 4 extra men working with him on the wall (2 on the wall, 2 chipping stones 
and 1 mixing cement). 

He's requesting $2,500-$3,000 a week because he's unable to pay his 4 extra workers and himself with 
$1,500.00 a week? 
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Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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On Jul 15, 2016, at 6:28 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

yes 

On Fri, Jul 15, 2016 at 6:27 AM, Ann Rodriquez < wrote: 
Hey Bossman, 

Just confirming... 

Mr. Malbranche will be paid $35,000.00 to complete (10ft. x 420ft) wall with stones, payments will 
be $1,500.00 a week until completion. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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