From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: "Martin G. Weinberg" <]} -
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL
Date: Tue, 02 Aug 2016 15:18:23 +0000

1 will deal with this when 1 return to new york sorry, let me see what the 1ssues are

On Tue, Aug 2, 2016 at 11:10 AM, Martin G. Weinberg &—P wrote:

Richard, have you resolved any issue regarding the prior unpaid invoices for legal work done in April and June 20167 |
can prepare an invoice for July — the hours were modest — but wanted to know whether its best to send as a stand alone

monthly invoice or to add the hours from the prior months. Thanks, Marty

Martin G Weinberg PC
20 Park Plaza
Suite 1000
Boston, MA 02116
Tel
Cell
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