
From: "Martin G. Weinberg" < 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevaeatioMkgmail.com> 

Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL 

Date: Tue, 02 Aug 2016 15:21:41 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

thank you 

From: jeffrey E. 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 11:18 AM 
To: Martin G. Weinberg 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL 

i will deal with this when i return to new york sorry, let me see what the issues are 

On Tue, Aug 2, 2016 at 11:10 AM, Martin G. Weinberg <-> wrote: 
Richard, have you resolved any issue regarding the prior unpaid invoices for legal work done in April and June 2016? I 
can prepare an invoice for July — the hours were modest — but wanted to know whether its best to send as a stand alone 
monthly invoice or to add the hours from the prior months. Thanks, Marty 
Martin G Weinberg PC 
20 Park Plaza 
Suite 1000 
Boston. MA 02116 
Tel
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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