
From: Ann Rodriquez  

To: Rich Kahn  

Cc: Jeffrey <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: RIO plant quote 

Date: Wed, 03 Aug 2016 17:51:35 +0000 

Attachments: Quote_50.2016.013_VFD.pdf 

Inline-Images: image001.png 

Hey Rich, 

Here is the Quote from TSG for the part needed to get the RIO Plant back up and running $3,249.34? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Kelli Gatti
Date: August 3, 2016 at 1:19:16 PM AST 
To: ann rodriquez 
Cc: Bob Petersen 

, Skip Cooper 
Subject: Quote 50.2016.013 VFD 

, Rich Murrill , Jonnie Melton 

Anna — Good afternoon to you. 

I have attached a quote for repairs to your water plant. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Thank you, 

Kelli Gatti 
Retail Procurement Specialist 
TSG Water Resources, Inc. 
2401-B NE 18th Terrace 
Gainesville FL 32609 
Office: 

EFTA00822647



EFTA00822648


