
From: Richard Kahn 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: accounting invoices 
Date: Mon, 25 Jul 2016 17:55:40 +0000 

Attachments: 201607221735.pdf; 201607221737.pdf 

attached are invoices for accounting services for david hasson and allan from nov 2015 thru June 2016 totaling 
31,125 
same period in previous year nov 2014 - june 2015 was 43,225 
note allan's time for leon is billed separately (cannot be much as all he did was overview a few returns) 

please advise if ok to pay via STC 
thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David Hasson < 
Date: July 22, 2016 at 5:40:43 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 

HI Rich, 

This updates us thru June. 

Thanks, and have a great weekend. 

D 

David M. Hasson CPA, PFS 
Seckendorf Hasson & Reilly CPA's, LLC 
3000 Marcus Avenue, Suite 3w4 
Lake Success NY 11042 
Phone - 
Fax - 

EFTA00823422


