
From: ann rodriquez

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationggmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: Funding for Temporary Contractors 

Date: Tue, 05 Jul 2016 18:06:58 +0000 

Attachments: Landscaping_Petty_Cash.xls 

Spread sheet attached for your review... 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Tuesday, July 5, 2016 1:39 PM, ann rodriquez 

Hey Bossman, 

I apologize for the miscalculation since I hired extra help to make things move faster. 

wrote: 

I have $1,330.00 on hand. I would need to request an additional $1,870.00 to cover this weeks payroll for the contractors that 
receive cash every Friday? 

Emile $600.00 a week 
Maho $600.00 a week 
Dale $500.00 a week 
Alfredo $500.00 a week 
Clint $500.00 a week 
Renal $500.00 a week 

Total cash pay out every Friday $3,200.00 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Thursday, June 30, 2016 11:30 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Ok 

On Thursday, 30 June 2016, Ann Rodriquez aMil > wrote: 
Hey Bossman, 

I would like to request Funding for the Temporary Contractors for this week (6/27-7/1) $3,000.00 and 
next week (7/4-7/8) $3,000.00. 
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Requesting amount for 2 weeks $6,000.00? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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