
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Lany Visoski 

Subject: Re: Heli 
Date: Tue, 24 Apr 2018 19:13:51 +0000 

Ok 

On The, Apr 24, 2018 at 3:02 PM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Thx„ 
Dave Burch got us the Actuator for $104,280 from Bell., 
List was $112k 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 24, 2018, at 2:14 PM, Jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

no choice 

On The, Apr 24, 2018 at 2:12 PM, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
No loaner actuators,. 
Actuator Price is $112k plus labor to install, David Burch is trying to acquire a Better discount from 
managnent in Fort Worth, Bell headquarters. 
The Actuator arrives in Fort Lauderdale tomorrow / Wed at 8am. 
•"" I would fly to San Juan tomorrow with the Bell Mechanic at noon. Spend the night in San Juan to 
arrive in St Thomas Thursday morning 930am... flights from Miami to St Thomas are sold out for the 
Noon departure Wednesday,. 
We would install the actuator Thursday morning, to be ready for your arrival Friday mom. 

I would have Dave and Chip fly the G550 to islip on Thursday if Eric agrees to accept the plane,,, then 
Dave and Chip would fly the GIV to St Thomas Friday morn, 
I would Remain in STT to fly the Heli upon your arrival. 
If you don't mind, I would fly the GIV with the Bell Mechanic to PBI Friday night with you. 

Do you approve of this plan? And Actuator purchase? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPad 
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