
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Invoice auction 
Date: Thu, 30 Jun 2016 15:34:56 +0000 

Attachments: FactureCOLLINBOCAGE27mail6.pdf 

is this purchase of a sculpture accurate in the amount of 625 euro? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Marie-Joseph Experton < 
Subject: EPSTEIN / Invoice auction 
Date: June 29, 2016 at 1:19:00 PM EDT 
To: bellaklein   >, Richard Kahn 

urgent 

PLEASE CONFIRM THAT I CAN PROCEED WITH THE PAYMENT OF THE ATTACHED INVOIEE CORRESPONDING TO 
A PURCHASE AT AN AUCTION LATE MAY WHICH NEEDS TO BE PAID IN ORDER TO GET THE PAINTING 
DELIVERED. I HAVE NO OTHER INFORMATION AND COULD NOT GET MORE DETAILS BY PHONE. 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 
Avocet au Barreau de Paris etabli a Bruxelles 
avenue Louise 65 bode 11 
1050 Bruxelles 
Belgique 
Tel. 
Fax 
GSM 

EFTA00824684



EFTA00824685


