
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeeyacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: 

Date: Tue, 21 Jun 2016 11:55:50 +0000 

Attachments: xls 

From: Bella Klein 
Date: Monday, June 20, 2016 at 10:05 PM 
To: c > 
Cc: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Re: Amex Blue June 14 statement - URGENT!!!! 

I don't think it is correct. She always asks first. You have a card for your personal expenses. Doctor is your expense . If you need 
your credit increased talk to JE, but you can't just decide what to do on your own. This card is strictly for work. 

Thank you, 

Bella 

On Jun 20, 2016, at 9:54 PM, < > wrote: 

Ok , I'll talk to JE . 
I asked which card she's using for Doctor expenses and she said blue card . That's why I used it . I thought it would be 
easy because then you don't have to transfer money back to my card. 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

From: Bella Klein 
Date: Monday, June 20, 2016 at 9:43 PM 
To: c > 
Cc: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Fwd: Amex Blue June 14 statement - URGENT!!!! 

I can accept Hamptons expenses as JE and taxis, but your medical, pharmacy and others- you have a personal card for it. I made 
it very clear that this Amex is only for JE expenses. Please reimburse JE for your personal expenses. You can't use his Amex to 
increase your personal limit. Please discuss with JE 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

EFTA00825231



From: IN 
Subject: Re: Fwd: Amex Blue June 14 statement - URGENT!!!! 
Date: June 20. 2016 at 9:12:31 PM EDT 
To: bellaklein < 
Reply-To: 

hello Bella 
there is my doctors visits 
taxi for work 
and hamptons trip with girls - mostly food. 
thank you 

On Monday, June 20, 2016 2:25 PM, bellaklein > wrote: 

Hi , 
Please send backup ASAP or i will be forced to speak to JE. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein 
Subject: Amex Blue June 14 statement 
Date: June 16, 2016 at 2:57:23 PM EDT 
To: 

Hi 

Attached pleas find JE Amex Blue statement. As this card used for JE purpose only, please provide 
backup and receipts for all charges. Please fill in description next to the charge and email back in 
excel format. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

EFTA00825232



EFTA00825233


