
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: FW: 124 Parc Monceau 
Date: Thu, 19 May 2016 20:24:24 +0000 

The reconciliation should be finished next week , The issue as you know is that the loan of 5 million dollars 
plus the interest due, is approx 5.6 ( fill in corrrect numebr ) this is more than the total received from the final 
sale. approx 5.35 mi, . paul will not see any money, and you and i will have to figure out what to do. 

On Thu, May 19, 2016 at 4:18 PM, Richard Kahn < 
Please advise how I shall respond. 
Thank you 

Rich 

wrote: 

From: Stephen Alexander <drsra@att.net>
Reply-To: Stephen Alexander <drsraaatt.net>
Date: Thursday, May 19, 2016 at 3:26 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fw: 124 Parc Monceau 

I have been contacted several times by Paul's sister and Charlie, Paul's estate personal 
representative, about the sale of the house. Do you have an estimate of when everything will be 
reconciled? Also, how can I help, if at all. 

Stephen R. Alexander, Psy.D. 
Clinical & Forensic Psychology 

On Wednesday. May 18. 2016 5:00 PM, Charles Barnett a wrote: 

Hi Steve, 

Any word on the proceeds from Parc Monceau? 

Best wishes, 
Charlie 

Charles D. Barnett 
Attorney at Law 

www.charlesbarnettlaw.com 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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