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Subject: Re: Question 
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Thank you very much ! 
Hope you aisfoying Paris . 
I emailed today to have details about next week , waiting for her reply back 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Thursday, May 12, 2016, 2:02 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

yes 

On Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:58 PM, > wrote: 
Hello Jeffrey , 
I had on my joint bank account with money for the apt rent , it was for May and June -
1204$+1204$=2.408$ 
From this amount Rich Kahn sent me email ( I attached the pic ) taxes money was taken . Amount to return 
was 1.841$ 
So from my apt rent amount which was 2408$ they took 1841$ , and rest is 567$. 
I have to pay may , June , July , August - while I'm waiting for my green card answer . 
Can Bella please transfer for me money for these month apt rent ( each month is 1.203,56$)?! 
Thank you 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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