From: "jcfirey E." -
To: Richard Kahn _

Subject: Re: GIV
Date: Tue, 03 May 2016 18:35:02 <0000

ok

On Tue, May 3, 2016 at 2:32 PM, Richard Kahn— wrote:
FYT - 3 meredian invoices (monthly, fan air valve swaps and filter replacements) are attached totaling
22.318.80

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Larry Visoski “
Subject: Fwd: Scan from Meridian Jet Center

Date: May 3, 20

For your backup

Amx

Jege LLC

Routine maintenance that Je requested in trouble shooting engine vibration on GIV

Pete will charge to my Amx if that works for you?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Pete Rawson *’-W
Date: May 3, 2016 at 11:21:07 AN

vo: [
Subject: FW: Scan from Meridian Jet Center
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