From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>

To: "Martin G. Weinberg" <] -

Subject: Re: common interest

Date: Fri, 22 Apr 2016 09:42:15 +0000

yvou do not need

On Thu, Apr 21, 2016 at 11:05 PM, Martin G. Weinberg <

= owrote:

Has GM attys asked you for waiver of confidentiality in the settlement with WVG? See transcript. See attached.
| do not need to review Maxwell case if Darren is regularly accessing it on SDNY electronic system. If not, a lot is

happening. Let me know.

From: Martin G. Weinberg

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2016 10:57 FM
To: jeevacation@gmail.com ;

Subject: Fw: common interest

Apparently, Sigrid is claiming some ongoing criminal investigation into GM. Court ordered disclosure. Edwards

represents Dersh case over by stipulation.

From: Borja, Mary

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2016 3:55 PM
To: Martin Weinberg

Subject: common interest

See pp. 5, 25 et seq.
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