
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 124 Parc Monceau 

Date: Sat, 02 Apr 2016 16:05:18 +0000 

Inline-Images: image001.gif 

it seems steinberg buyers were all stories 

On Fri, Apr 1, 2016 at 9:34 PM, Richard Kahn < 
Moens client Donna ward sent 500,000 in today. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke 
Date: April I, 2016 at 11:46:22 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Fwd: 124 Parc Monceau 

Looks like they are moving forward. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

wrote: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2016 Darren K. 
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Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Nan Bolz <nanbolz@horizontitle.net>
Subject: 124 Parc Monceau 
Date: April 1, 2016 at 11:38:04 AM EDT 
To: Darren Indyke 

Cc: Kathy Branco <kathy@horizontitle.net>

Darren and Kerry, we received a wire of the $500,000 deposit this morning. 
Kerry, please furnish us with contract information for the buyer and feel free to contact me or Kathy Branco of our 
office with any questions. 
Thanks 

Nan B. Bolz, Esq. 
Horizon Title Services, Inc. 

Bolz & Bolz, Attorneys at Law 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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