
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 124 Parc Monceau *Contract* 
Date: Thu, 31 Mar 2016 15:30:08 +0000 

sign it 

On Thu, Mar 31, 2016 at 11:25 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 
see moens response below 
i have asked kerry for past 4 days to call all other buyers and put forth best offer - still waiting for something in 
writing 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Warwick, Kerry" 
Subject: Fwd: 124 Parc Monceau *Contract* 
Date: March 31, 2016 at 11:19:35AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn Darren Indyke < 

Sent from my iPhone 

KERRY WARWICK 

REALTOR ASSOCIATE 

DOUGLAS ELLIMAN REAL ESTATE 

SOCIAL: ASKELLIMAN / FACEBOOK TWITTER i GOOGLE+ / YOUTUBE / PINTEREST / LINKEDIN 

VIEW MY LISTINGS 
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This email is for the use of the intended recopenfts) only. If you have recanted this email in error. please notify the sender immelately and then detete a. II you are not tr, 
intended recipient. you must not keep. use. desclose. copy or distribute thrs email without the author's prior permission. We have taken precautions to minimize the nSk of 
transmitting sofhvate viruses. but we advise you to carry out your own virus checks on any attachment to thrs message. We cannot accept habiaty for any loss or damage 
caused by software viruses. The informabon contained in this communication may be confidential and may be submcl to the attorney-client privesge. If you are the intended 
recipient and you do not wish to receive sirnilar etectronic messages from us n the future then please respond to the sender to this effect. Please note that any views or 
opinions presented in this e•med are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the Company. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lawrence Moens
Date: March 31, 2016 at 11:16:27 AM EDT 
To: "Warwick,Kerry" 
Subject: Re: 124 Parc Monceau *Contract* 
Reply-To: Lawrence Moens 

Dear Kerry, 

The Buyer wanted to offer $5,600,000 but we were able to get her to offer $5,700,000. Please keep me 
posted. Thank you. 

Sincerely, 
Chrisitne Curry 
Assistant to Mr. Moens 

----Original Message-----

From: "Warwick, Kerry"

Sent: Mar 31, 2016 9:42 AM 

To: Lawrence Moens 

Subject: Re: 124 Parc Monceau *Contract* 

Hi Christine. 

Thank you for this email. The seller wanted me to ask if $5,700,000 is the buyers best price ($100000 off 
previous offer) 

Thx so much 

Kerry 

Sent from my iPhone 
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KERRY WARWICK 

REALTOR ASSOCIATE 

DOUGLAS ELLIMAN REAL ESTATE 

This email is for the use of the intended recipient(s) only. If you have received this email in error, please 
notify the sender immediately and then delete it. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not keep, 
use, disclose, copy or distribute this email without the author's prior permission. We have taken 
precautions to minimize the risk of transmitting software viruses, but we advise you to carry out your own 
virus checks on any attachment to this message. We cannot accept liability for any loss or damage caused 
by software viruses. The information contained in this communication may be confidential and may be 
subject to the attorney-client privilege. If you are the intended recipient and you do not wish to receive 
similar electronic messages from us in the future then please respond to the sender to this effect. Please 
note that any views or opinions presented in this e-mail are solely those of the author and do not 
necessarily represent those of the Company. 

On Mar 30, 2016, at 4:31 PM, Lawrence Moens < › wrote: 

Dear Kerry, 

Attached please find a contract on the above captioned property for review and execution with your 
Seller. If you have any questions, please contact Mr. Moens at your first convenience. Thank you. 

Sincerely, 

Chrisitne Curry 

Assistant to Mr. Moens 

<20160330150954456.pdf> 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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