
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn  
Subject: Re: JetSuite Off Fleet Quote 

Date: Thu, 17 Mar 2016 19:02:09 +0000 

Lear 

On Thursday, 17 March 2016, Richard Kahn k- wrote: 
attached are two options for return tonight at 8pm 

additional cost for hawker 800 2,871.41 
additional cost for lear 55 1,242.78 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Charter Team < 
Subject: JetSuite Off Fleet Quote 
Date: March 17. 2016 at 2:47:16 PM EDT 
To: Mark Wieser < 

I kilo Richard, 
Attached are two options for tonights trip from BED-TEB. The Hawker 800XP has a WIFI and a brand new interior. As 
Mark explained you can use the funds for the leg tonight and then pay the difference. The extra amount would be 
$2871.41 for the Hawker 800XP, and the cost for the Lear 55 would be $1242.78. Thank you very much and please let us 
know if there is anythign else we can do for you. 

Eric Dufay 
JetSuite Charter 
o.866.779.7770 ext 5 

Offering VVIFI-equipped Phenom 100s & CJ3s. 
To Fly: 866 779 7770 

LEGAL DISCLAIMER 
The information transmuted is intended solely for the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review retransmission, dissemination or other use of or taking action in 
reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this 
email in error please contact the sender and delete the material from any computer 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
WE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gtnail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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