
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski <1.a> 
Cc: Rich Kahn 

Subject: Re: Upcoming Trips 
Date: Sun, 06 Mar 2016 10:48:05 +0000 

rich, get the best price and yes book at for 10 am 

On Sat, Mar 5, 2016 at 10:26 PM, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
The Lear 70 is not available, owner needs the aircraft, 
I have Hawker 800 that is available, should I book it? 
It's nonrefundable full commitment TEB-PBI 
Monday 11am 
$13,343 
Pls advise 

Thx 
Larryv 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Chris Napoli • 
Date: March 5, 2016 at 10:20:14 PM EST 
To: Larry Visoski 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Upcoming Trips 

Hey Larry, 

I heard from them and the owner won't release the plane. I apologize for the inconvenience and I don't know 
why they quoted it in the first place. I did find a cheaper Platinum rated Hawker 400XP if that interests you 
guys. Please let me know what you think. I look forward to hearing from you. 

Best, 
Chris 

On Sat, Mar 5, 2016 at 6:29 PM, Larry Visoski a wrote: 
Hello Chris, Jeffrey really wants to use the Learjet 70 can you confirm that it is a complete cancel at this 
point? Thanks Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 5, 2016, at 8:41 PM, Chris Napoli • > wrote: 
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Hey Richard, 

I apologize for the delay! I have been going back and forth with the operator because the jet's owner will 
not give clearance for this trip due to them potentially needing the jet. I told them I needed to know asap, 
but I guess they are having trouble pushing their owner. I am re-checking on the additional options to 
make sure they are still available. I will get back to you asap! 

Best, 
Chris 

On Sat, Mar 5, 2016 at 5:36 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
We would like to confirm Lear 70 for Monday. Please confirm it is available and please send photos. 
Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
Ne 2 
Tel 
Fa 
Ce 

On Mar 5, 2016, at 4:06 PM, Chris Napoli < > wrote: 

Hey Richard, 

We are working on this right now and are confirming with our operator partner that it is still available. 
I will send over the formal quote once I hear back from them. Let me know if you need anything else 
in the meantime. 

Best, 
Chris 

On Sat, Mar 5, 2016 at 12:46 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

Hearing that Lear 70 may be best choice for Monday. Please advise if still available and when we 
must confirm by. Thank you. 

Rich 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 4, 2016, at 5:38 PM, Chris Napoli

Hey Richard, 

> wrote: 

I wanted to follow up and confirm you received the options from earlier! We received some lower 
priced options but they were Gold safety rated. I believe you guys usually only want Platinum, 
correct? Below is an options for the trip to St. Thomas: 

Option: Lear 60 = $20,392.89 
- Platinum Safety rated 
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Let me know if you have any feedback! 

Best, 
Chris 

On Fri, Mar 4, 2016 at 11:32 AM, Chris Napoli < > wrote: 
Hey Richard, 

Great speaking to you earlier! We are working on this now but wanted to send over a couple 
options that have come through! Below is for the trip on 3/7: 

Option 1: Hawker 400XP = $11,225.29 
- ARG/US Platinum 
- Complimentary Wifi 
Option 2: Lear 70 = $12,752.49 
- ARG/US Gold 
Option 3: Piaggio P180 = $10,476.01 
- ARG/US Gold 

I will let you know as more options come through along with the trip to St. Thomas. Let me know if you 
have any questions or feedback! 

Best, 
Chris 

Chris Napoli 
Managing Partner 
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Chris Napoli 
Managing Partner 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00832478


