
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 17 Apr 2018 12:49:28 +0000 

is this proper account for $600 wire 
please confirm 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel

l
fa 
ce 

> On Apr 16, 2018, at 12:25 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

> <IMG-7656.JPG> 
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