
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Joslin <1 

Subject: Re: favor 

Date: Tue, 26 Jan 2016 01:34:23 +0000 

ok ill check 

On Mon, Jan 25, 2016 at 8:29 PM, Richard Joslin > wrote: 
I had sent you the final invoice in September and that was when LDB helped pay which he did on Oct 7. So it 
appears the first half tuition was not made. 

On Monday, January 25, 2016, Jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 
my recollection was that you told me that it was paid, by brad 

On Mon, Jan 25, 2016 at 8:16 PM, Richard Joslin 

Rich/ Jeffrey: 

> wrote: 

Can you help look and see on your end that this June invoice was paid? I just received a letter from my son's 
school about a failure to pay tuition and I am investigating on my end. 

Please let me know at your earliest convenience. 

Thanks 

Ft1 

From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Thursday, June 04, 2015 12:05 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: favor 

thanks for this. heartfelt thanks. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00835673


