
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: N908JE TCAS 
Date: Fri, 15 Jan 2016 17:06:49 +0000 

Ok 

On Friday, 15 January 2016, Richard Kahn 
please advise if ok to pay 41,966.72 for TCAS 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel
xafl

cel

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski <MEfl 
Subject: Fwd: N908JE TCAS 
Date: January 14, 2016 at 1:23:20 PM EST 
To: Je vacation <jeevacation@gmail.corn>, Rich Kahn 

Jeffrey 
TCAS installed in B727 
$41,966.72 
Is this approved to wire payment? 

Thx 
Larryv 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Yeimi Montoya
Date: Janu 14 2016 at 1:20:13 PM EST 
To:"
Cc: Erica Hernandez Christopher Jelinek < > 
Subject: N908JE 

> wrote: 

Good afternoon 
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Please find attached invoice for TCAS processor update along with wire transfer instructions for payment. 
Do not hesitate to give us a call if you have any questions. 

Best regards 

Yeimi Montoya 
Avionics Administrator 
Dedicated to earning customer loyalty through excellence in aviation services. 
Banyan Air Services. Inc. 
Fort Lauderdale Executive Airport (FXE) 
5360 NW 20 Terrace 
Ft. Lauderdale FL 33309 

main direct fax 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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