From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: Carlos Rodriguez f—}
Subject: Re: PRD
Date: Mon, 11 Jan 2016 17:37:38 +0000

ok

On Mon, Jan 11, 2016 at 1:30 PM, Carlos Rodriguez &_* wrote:
Good afternoon all, | have located a new lower unit for PRD starboard engine the cost with shipping
will be approx 3,800.00 dollars , that is to tropical shipping. They do not accept CC payments of this
amount over the phone, so they will send wire info if we go ahead with purchase.
Thankyou
Carlos

On Saturday, January 9, 2016 10:16 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationi@gmail.com=> wrote:

ok

On Sat, Jan 9, 2016 at 10:11 AM, Carlos Rodriguez <[l NG . ote:
Greetings all, yesterday afternoon Peter drove prd to redhook as he was leaving they hit
something on the bottom, i saw they had the motors up but when | left Isj they were already going
again. When | saw the people that traveled in prd they said they might have snagged on a rope.
This morning after close exam the propeller is banged up and the engine fin is broken. Im looking
for a propeller to replace and will repor t if that will fix the problem and report back after testing.

Sent from my iPhone
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