
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Privileged and Confidential - GSJ 
Date: Fri, 08 Jan 2016 19:48:06 +0000 

haze 

On Fri, Jan 8, 2016 at 3:42 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
please confirm ok to send wire today from your personal account 
shall i fund your personal account from Haze with 47.6mm in cash or STC 114mm in cash 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

22 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke < 
Subject: Privileged and Confidential - GSJ 
Date: January 8, 2016 at 2:37:55 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn ica 

Please wire $20MM to Erika Kellerhal's firm account to pay for the balance of the purchase price and closing 
costs for the purchase of GSJ. $20 MM will more than cover the closing costs and give us a cushion if 
required and whatever is not used will be returned. Send the funds from the same account you sent them last 
time. Thanks. 

Darren 

Sent from my iPad 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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