
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: >, Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 05 Jan 2016 16:47:45 -4)000 

ok 

On Tue, Jan 5, 2016 at 11:34 AM, MINIa wrote: 
Hello my Jeffrey , 
I'm still sick , but def. feel better and hope to see you before you leave !!! 
Jeffrey may I ask you , Bella is asking to your approval regarding 
80$ change the seat at the plane , 160$ I paid for our luggage with , and 220$ I've spent for new sport ski 
trousers ( I tore mine ) while we were skiing . 
And also I broke my phone when I was skiing I need to go to the Apple Store and fix the screen , can Bella 
will refund this too ?! Please 
Please 

Thank you 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 
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