From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: Brad Wechsler ﬂ_*, Joe Avantario _
Subject: Re:
Date: Sun, 27 Dec 2015 01:08:44 0000

also lets make sure the last payment includes the interest charges incurred so that the dec 31 balance 15 zero
owed

On Sat, Dec 26, 2015 at 6:47 PM, Brad Wechsler <[ N - 1o'¢:

That makes sense to me. Let me coordinate with joe on logistics. Hope all is well.
Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 26, 2015, at 11:21 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

[ suggest that after the sale of noel calb for the 260. leon then pays 10 m personally to ste ., return 250 to
bank,
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