
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Larry Visoski <a, Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Re: Scanned from Meridian Hangar 107 

Date: Sun, 08 Apr 2018 23:47:08 +0000 

https://www.ainonline.cotn/aviation-news/business-aviation/2016-10-30/new-aircraft-lighting-leds-replace-
fluorescents 

On Mon, Apr 9, 2018 at 12:10 AM, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
LED light quote from Pete person that met us at Jet Aviation„ supposedly same guy Eric uses: 

Hi Pete, 

Based on the numbers you have given me here is the standard quote for such a conversion. Let me know if 
you need any other information and I look forward to hearing your feedback. 

Thanks, 

Shervin 

ORIGINAL 
PNS ALI PN 

QUANTI 
TY Cost Each TOTAL 

5800-300-
L1235-754 18 $851.00 $15,318.00 252000

5800-105-
1.1235-265 3 $400.00 $1,200.00 252000

5800-285-
L1235-720 24 $851.00 $20,424.00 52000 

5800-120-
L 1235-300 8 $400.00 $3,200.00 252000

41014MLIPIPAYglPhalW058 20 $15.00 $300.00 

146'L2P42,,,,i ri N2022)( 4 $700.00 $2,800.00 

Grand Total $43,242.00 

From: Pete Rawson
Date: A ril 9, 2018 at 12:00:11 AM GMT+2 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: Scanned from Meridian Hangar 107 

Hi Pete, 

Based on the numbers you have given me here is the standard quote for such a conversion. Let me know if 
you need any other information and I look forward to hearing your feedback. 

Thanks, 

Shervin 

EFTA00838635



ORIGINAL PNS ALI PN QUANTITY Cost Each TOTAL 
5800-300-

252000 L1235-754 18 S851.00 $15,318.00 
5800-105-

252000 L1235-265 3 S400.00 $1,200.00 
5800-285-

252000 L1235-720 24 S851.00 $20,424.00 
5800-120- 

sirn,?1299P L1235-300 8 S400.00 $3,200.00 
Adapter Plug 41058 20 $15.00 $300.00 

AL-2042 N2022-X 4 5700.00 $2,800.00 
Grand Total 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

$43,242.00 

EFTA00838636


