From: " - -
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 15 Dec 2015 18:22:12 +0000

Can 1 call u?
Ariane de Rothschild

Le 15 déc. 2015 a 18:13, jeffrey E. <jeevacationf@gmail.com> a écrit ;

Im wondering wheter we should separaate the payments from lugano and geneva and can we dedicut the
penalty as a biz expense.to maintain reputaion or some classification. ete

On Tue, Dec 15, 2015 at 12:09 PM, _ _‘* wrote:

Ok
Ariane de Rothschild

Le 15 dec. 2015 4 18:08, jeffrey E. <jeevacation{@ gmail.com™ a éerit :

[ would prefer that all monies are transfered penalties fees, legal etc before benj meeting

please note
The information contained in this communication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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