From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Bob Crowe <
Subject: Re: Re:
Date: Mon, 14 Dec 2015 23:39:33 +0000

how surprising, was any progress made. 7 what should 1 tell them?

On Mon, Dec 14, 2015 at 6:04 PM, Bob Crowe ‘:i_-} wrote:

We did not get the 550,000 promised by 11-30!

Robert B. Crowe | Nelson Mullins
One Post Office Square, 30th Fl., Boston, MA 02109

101 Constitution Avenue NW, Washington, DC 20001
|

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, November 06, 2015 1:23 PM

To: Bob Crowe

Subject: Re:

ok first step

On Fri, Nov 6, 2015 at 1:15 PM, Bob Crowe .::_;, wrote:

We just got a check for $100,000-we will deposit and let you know when it clears! Thank you

Sent from my 1Phone

On Nov 6, 2015, at 8:34 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfrgmail.com™> wrote:

I guess 1 should rescind my thank you note to them

On Fri, Nov 6, 2015 at 8:32 AM. Bob Crowe <|| GG - o

I was wrong - we did not get it - [ got 150,000 wire yesterday but it was from another client

Sent from my iPhone
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On Nov 6, 2015, at 7:06 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@/gmail.com=> wrote:

im told money sent ?
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