
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Ada Clapp

Subject: Re: Emailing: Packet #1.pdf 

Date: Mon, 14 Dec 2015 18:04:11 +0000 

ok 

On Mon, Dec 14, 2015 at 12:51 PM, Ada Clapp < wrote: 

Please see attached revisions to Receipt for payment of interest and principal on 12.22 

Ada Clapp 

Chief Legal Officer 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Avenue 

Suite 1401 

New York, New York 10022 

Email: 

This communication and any attachment is for the intended recipient(s) only and may contain information that is 
privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that further 
dissemination of this communication and its attachments is prohibited. Please delete all copies of this communication 
and its attachments and notify me immediately that you have received them in error. Thank you. 

From: jeffrey E. [mailtoieevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, December 11, 2015 7:37 PM 
To: Ada Clapp < 
Subject: Re: Emailing: Packet #1.pdf 

i want a seperate interest payment received 
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On Fri, Dec 11, 2015 at 7:31 PM, Ada Clapp < > wrote: 

Yes—it will be paid in two separate wires but one receipt from Trustees. Wouldn't make sense to pay off interest on 
a portion unless you were also paying principal. 

Ada Clapp 

Chief Legal Officer 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Avenue 

Suite 1401 

New York, New York 10022 

Email: 

This communication and any attachment is for the intended recipient(s) only and may contain information that is 
privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that 
further dissemination of this communication and its attachments is prohibited. Please delete all copies of this 
communication and its attachments and notify me immediately that you have received them in error. Thank you. 

From: jeffrey E. (mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com)
Sent: Friday, December 11, 2015 7:31 PM 
To: Ada Clapp < > 
Subject: Re: Emailing: Packet #1.pdf 

interest payment is a seperate payment . not part of larger 

On Fri, Dec 11, 2015 at 7:14 PM, Ada Clapp < wrote: 

please note 

EFTA00838911



The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.corn, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeela®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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