From: Richard Kahn _}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days
Date: Wed, 09 Dec 2015 04:45:27 +0000

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lvjet <[ N

Date: December 8, 2015 at 11:10:06 PM EST
To:

Subject: Re: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days

Rich,
Appears Dave is charging $1,000 for Cancel flight days this year. along with his training days, as we have paid in the
past.

On April 2nd, Dave and i airlined to STT for an afternoon departure, JE decided to depart the next moming, Dave
charged $1,000 for that Day, instead of $500.

On MNov 28th, Dave shows up at airport at 4pm, for a trip to STT, weather was bad in STT and JE decided to depart the
next morn, Dave spent 1 hour at the airport. charged $1,000

other Dates appear correct, many days of sitting for $1,000 / | have Dave at $144k plus 13,500 airline days, total to Date
12/2/2015 $157,500.00

Rich

How much did we pay Bill Hammond, does it make sense to give more contract Flying days to Bill Hammeond, and lower
Dave's?

this would allow me to have B727¥ covered when JE wants to fly, Currently JE is trying to decide whether he will allow
more flying for Bill, so he doesn't take another Job offer that was presented in Ecplise Jet.

If we Take $157,500 Dave made in 2015 and Bill Hammond earnings in 2015, split it between Dave and Bill for earning,
this will give me two guys for the price of One? and gives me a full crew for the BY27 when needed., just a thought.

Mot sure why Dave highlights weekend Days he works on his spread sheet, maybe we should give him weekends off as
well? don't forget, he's a banker, not a pilot.

thoughts?

tho,
Larry

-—-Original Message--——-
From: Richard Kahn <
To: Larry Visoski = >
Sent: Tue, Dec 8, 2015 3:43 pm
Subject: Fwd: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days

EFTA00839280



please review

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Subject: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days

Date: December 8, 2015 at 12:05:16 PM EST
To:

Hi Rich,

Attached are my 2015 work days through December 2, 2015. | would prefer to receive the payment next month in 2016.
Have a happy holiday season!

Dave Rodgers

EFTA00839281



