
From: Richard Kahn 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 

Date: Fri, 06 Apr 2018 20:21:31 +0000 

Attachments: 1693_001.pdf; RADYCA_Wire_instructions.pdf 

Inline-Images: image001.png 

please advise on travel expense totaling 4,645.27 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa) 
ce 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lorena Villacorta  fr" 
Subject: Invoice 
Date: April 6, 2018 at 3:59:12 PM EDT 
To: 
Cc: 

Good afternoon 

Hope this email finds you well. 

Attached you can find the invoice for the trip to the Island on March 25th to 27th, also the wire instructions. 
Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Have a good weekend! 

Regards, 

Lorena Villacorta 
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