
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Palm Tree order from Palmco 

Date: Fri, 06 Apr 2018 20:53:52 +0000 

wirh 

On Fri, Apr 6, 2018 at 10:53 PM, Richard Kahn < 
with or without the diamond cut? 
shall i have chris tag the 4? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
Ne 22 
tel 
fa 
cel 

On Apr 6, 2018, at 4:44 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

buy 4 18feet , 

On Fri, Apr 6, 2018 at 10:40 PM, Richard Kahn

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
eel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Francisco Castaneda  
Subject: Re: Palm Tree order from Palmco 
Date: April 6, 2018 at 4:33:56 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn c > 

> wrote: 

wrote: 
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The maximum height is approximately 18'CT. 

Francisco Castaneda 

Customer Service Associate 
14401 Harbor Dyne 
Bokeelia,  FL 33922 
Office Fax: Cell: 
Email: 

On Fri, Apr 6, 2018 at 4:26 PM, Richard Kahn < 
looks vety nice 
what is maximum height? 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New Y rk NY 10022 
tel 

ce 

> wrote: 

On Apr 6, 2018, at 2:35 PM, Francisco Castaneda < > wrote: 

Good afternoon Richard, 

The field is certified to ship overseas, and they do have plenty to choose from 
Attached a couple pictures of a sylvester with and without the diamond cut. 
Without the diamond cut on the trunk, they are $125/FT CT. 
With the diamond cut, they are $150/FT CT. 

Depending on how many of what size you need, we can fit 6-10 of these on a flat rack. 

Thank you, 

<IMG_1392.JPG> 
<IMG_1685.JPG> 

Francisco Castafieda 

Customer Service Associate 

EFTA00841567



14401 Harbor Drive 
Bokeelia FL 33922 
Office Fax: Cell: 
Email: 

On Fri, Apr 6, 2018 at 1:52 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
any update or pictures on larger sylvestors? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
75 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

New York NY 10022 

fa 
ce 

On Apr 5, 2018, at 4:27 PM, Francisco Castaneda < > wrote: 

We can get taller sylvesters from other fields, just have to make sure those fields are certified to 
ship overseas. 
I can get back to you with specs and pricing. 

Everything went smoothly this morning, just as planned. 

Thanks, 

Francisco Castaiieda 

Ii 
Customer Service Associate 
14401 Harbor Drive 
Bokeelia FL 33922 
Office: i Fax: 
Email: 

Cell: 

On Thu, Apr 5, 2018 at 4:09 PM, Daphne Wallace < > wrote: 
Greetings Francisco and Matt, 

Did everything go as planned this morning? 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Thu, Apr 5, 2018 at 3:04 PM, Francisco Castaneda < > wrote: 
Good afternoon Daphne, 

We have small Canary palms 2-3'CT. They are $300/FT CT. 
If you need something taller, we have beautiful Sylvesters up to 8'CT. 

Thank you, 

Francisco Castaiieda 
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a 
Customer Service Associate 
14401 Harbor Drive 
Bokeelia,  FL 33922 
Office: Fax: 
Email: 

Cel 

On Thu, Apr 5, 2018 at 2:20 PM, Daphne Wallace <1 > wrote: 
Greetings Francisco and Matt, 

Do you have Canary palms available? If so what sizes do you have? 

Kind regards Daphne 

On Mon, Apr 2, 2018, 1:03 PM Francisco Castaneda 
Hello Daphne, 

> wrote: 

Matt informed me that you are interested in getting the load of coconuts that was 
postponed from last year. 
Can you please let me know what day you are planning on arranging transportation, we 
will require 2 flat racks for the 14 coconuts. 
This week is filling up quickly, so hopefully we can schedule you in for when you need. 

Thank you 
Francisco Castaneda 

Customer Service Associate 
14401 Harbor Drive 
Bokeelia FL 33922 
Office Fax 
Email: 

Cell 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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