From: "jeffrey E." <[
To: [N I -
Subject: Re: -. Invoice

Date: Mon, 02 Nov 2015 00:00:09 +0000

i dont care find out if school will pay and no matter waht 1 will pay the difference or all .

On Sun, Nov 1, 2015 at 6:52 PM, [N TGN _ wrote:

[ am trying to get 60 % of this covered by my school insurance and can work a way to cover the rest myself if
that would be helpful.

Thank you

On Sun, Nov 1, 2015 at 6:39 PM, jeffrey E. *_'5* wrote:

——————— Forwarded messa
From: Paul Conti <
Date: Sun, Nogell 2015 at 6:34 PM
Subject: Invoice
To: "
Ce: Paul Conti <

Tc Emmsmam=

Jeffrey,

I hope you are enjoying the weekend. Iam attaching the October invoice for |l 1 sent her a message
today to ask how things are going, and for reflections upon our first meetings, which should allow me to
plan ahead. | am back in New York the week of November &, and will meet with her early in the week, and
potentially later in the week as well. I haven not done anything by phone, as [ think in-person 1s much
better, at least at this point. Please let me know if you have any questions. Take care,

Paul

From: jeffrey E. [ G-
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2015 9:53 PM
To: Paul Conti

Subject: Re:

what ever you and sue work out ok with me

leffrey,

Thank you for your confidence regarding il 1 absolutely believe that I know how to both understand
and help her, and will do my best. Please email or call any time -- ||| | | . Given the financial cycle
of a small business, I usually invoice monthly. If that sounds okay, I can forward it on to you however you
prefer. I will be in New York again the week of November 8, and | believe my assistant has already
scheduled ). Hope you are well. Take care,

Paul
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From: jeffrey E. |
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2015 11:19 AM
To: Paul Conti

Subject: Re: -.

oive me anumber for 6307

On Wed, Oct 21, 2015 at 2:19 PM, Paul Conti

< - o, ot
Definitely -- should we set a time? 1 can talk any time after 6:30 this evening, or we can figure out
something tomorrow if you have availability.

Sent from my 1Phone

On Oct 21, 2015, at 1:33 PM, jeffrey E. f_\’muilm:_'-?*l?* wrote:

speak?

On Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 8:11 PM, Paul Conti

< - - o, - 1ot

leffrey,

I hope that you are well. I saw [l 1ast night. and although she was in a high degree of distress, I was
impressed by her resourcefulness and intelligence. I believe that [ can help her, and that she 1s absolutely
capable of vastly improving her mental health. Medications are a part of this picture, but in the long run,
only a small part. The real change will come through psychotherapy, and we set the groundwork for this last
night. | spent two hours with her last night, and we are scheduled for 60-90 minutes on Friday. At this
point, I want to check in with you to learn if vou are okay with paying for therapy through me, or if she
should try to seek this through a different route. [ certainly would like to work with her, but I think its just a
reasonable courtesy for me to ensure that I am not planning something before we have discussed if you are
comfortable paying for it! My rates are pretty simple -- $1,500 for 90 minutes during intake, and $800 per
hour thereafter. Please let me know what you think. And, as its no surprise that you are a fascinating guy to
talk to, if vou are interested in meeting again under whatever circumstances vou might prefer, please let me
know! Take care,

Paul

From: Paul Conti

Sent: Friday, October 09, 2015 12:07 AM
To: jeffrey E.

Ce: Paul Conti

Subject: RE: Re-connection

Thank you -- she emailed me, and I will get in touch with her tomorrow and set up an appointment for when
I am in New York the week of October 18. T appreciate yvour trust, and will take the best care of her that [
can.

From: jeffrey E. [  NNEEEGEGN

Sent: Thursday, October 08, 2015 3:55 PM
To: Paul Conti
Subject: Re: Re-connection
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1 gave her vour emaill her name is _ a tiny woman. weighs .puunds._ is taking 30 mg
cymbalta . has trouble getting motivated | suffers anxiety, and is not doing well. thanks bill me of course

On Thu, Oct 8, 2015 at 6:45 PM, Paul Cont

< - o - ot

Thank you Peter for facilitating the re-connection! Jeffrey, | found the time spent with you to be enjoyable
and fascinating, and | appreciate your hospitality. I welcome helping your friend if I can. Would you like to
set something up through assistants, or let me know a few days/times that would work for vou? Thanks very
much,

Paul

From: Peter Attia [111ui1m:_<n111i]1u:_]

Sent: Thursday, October 08, 2015 1:55 PM

To: jeffrey E. < ‘mailto: == Paul Conti
= “mailto: e

Subject: Re-connection

Paul, Jeffrey has a friend he’d like you to possibly help with.
Peter

Peter Attia, M.D. | Attia Medical, PC | Principal | [ KGR -t (1) The information

contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information, including patient
information protected by federal and state privacy laws. It 15 intended only for the use of the person(s)
named above. If you are not the intended recipient, vou are hereby notified that any review, dissemination,
distribution, or duplication of this communication 1s strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privilezed, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If vou have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to , and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
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the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to h: and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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