
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Jeanne 

Subject: Re: FW: Anna's Salary 

Date: Fri, 30 Oct 2015 16:48:21 +0000 

yes 

On Fri, Oct 30, 2015 at 12:41 PM, Jeanne <1 

Jeffrey 

Should I process $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for Oct ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com
Sent: Friday, September 25, 2015 8:52 AM 
To: Jeanne •c Mi> 
Subject: Re: Anna's Salary 

Yes 

On Friday, 25 September 2015, Jeanne 

Jeffrey 

Should I process 3000 monthly WE bonus for Sept ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeanne [mailto 
Sent: Monday, August 31, 2015 1:10 PM 
To: 'jeevacation@gmail.com' <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: Anna's Salary 

Jeffrey 

Should I process 53000 monthly LSJE bonus for August ? 

Jeanne 

> wrote: 

> wrote: 
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From: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht [mailto 
Sent: Monday, July 27, 2015 2:22 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: FW: Anna's Salary 

Jeffrey 

Should I process $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for July ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, June 30, 2015 12:02 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: FW: Anna's Salary 

Jeffrey 

Should I processMS3000 monthly LSJE bonus for June ? 

Jeanne 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Friday, May 29, 2015 9:05 AM 
To: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht 
Subject: Re: FW: Anna's Salary 

yes 

On Fri, May 29, 2015 at 8:29 AM, Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht < > wrote: 
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Jeffrey 

Should I process■ $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for May ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 3:44 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: Anna's Salary 

Jeffrey 

Should I process■ $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for Apr ? 

Jeanne 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2015 9:58 AM 
To: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht 
Subject: Re: Anna's Salary 

Yes 

On Tuesday, March 31, 2015, Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht < 

Jeffrey 

Should I process 3000 monthly LSJE bonus for Mar ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, February 27, 2015 6:08 AM 
To: 'jeffrey E.' 
Subject: RE: Anna's Salary 

wrote: 
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Jeffrey 

Should I process■ $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for feb ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, January 29, 2015 8:11 AM 
To: 'jeffrey E.' 
Subject: RE: Anna's Salary 

Jeffrey 

seShould I proces 3000 monthly LSJE bonus for Jan ? 

Jeanne 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, December 29, 2014 7:14 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht 
Subject: Re: Anna's Salary 

yes 

On Mon, Dec 29, 2014 at 12:06 PM, Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht 

Jeffrey 

Should I proces $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for Dec ? 

Jeanne 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Tuesday, November 25, 2014 2:13 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht 
Subject: Re: FW: Anna's Salary 

> wrote: 

yes 
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On Tue, Nov 25, 2014 at 1:05 PM, Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht < 

Jeffrey 

Should I procesM$3000 monthly bonus for Nov? 

Jeanne 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

> wrote: 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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