From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: [N I I
Subject: Re:
Date: Thu, 29 Oct 2015 01:52:06 +0000

Ok
On Wednesday, 28 October 2015, | N IEGEG -

[ spoke to Aetna (my school insurance) and they say they pay 60% of

school |

Next move 1s to get invoice from Conti assistant or rich and send to them

and it doesn't have to be

On Wed, Oct 28, 2015 at 7:51 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfagmail.com™> wrote:

did you get info on school coverage fro ?
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