
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski clia> 

Subject: Re: N212JE 
Date: Mon, 19 Oct 2015 15:59:23 +0000 

Ok 

On Monday, 19 October 2015, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
May have your approval to pay Gulfstream for boost pump and EMI filter change, 
-Pump $12,067.89 
-EMI filter controller $9,735.99 
-Tax and labor is remaining portion, 
Total invoice $24,393.99 

Is this approved for wire transfer? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin fonvarded message: 

From: 
Date: Uctober 19, 2015 at 10:56:07 AM EDT 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: N212JE 

Good Morning Larry, hope all is well. Please find attached the prelim and credit card authorization per your request. If you 
have any questions please let us know. Once you complete the form send it back, I'll get it processed, and email you the 
receipt. 

We will check on the shades and get back to you. 

Thanks, 

Ray Kraber 
Senior Service Center Coordinator 
Gulfstream 

Office) 
Cell) 
Fax) 

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain Personal 
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any 
Personal Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service 
providers and may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third 
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parties. If you are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have either received this message in error or 
through interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is 
strictly prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views 
and not those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation. 
If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original 
message. 

From: RayLar7zrker: 
To: . Ron Bystrom .: :.. 
Date: 10/19/201509:12AM 
Subject: N212JE 

Hi Ron and Ray,. 
I had my main boost pump changed over the weekend, can you send me Amx form to pay for this? 
Also,. By any chance, Did you order replacement cockpit window shades for me? They were damaged when we did Fan 
balance by accident, they got folded and damaged the tint screen, they look terrible, 

Thx 
Larry 
Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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