
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: LSJ GSJ

Subject: Re: LSJ_SANFRANS_DEJOUR_040318 
Date: Tue, 03 Apr 2018 15:25:37 +0000 

of course 

On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 5:24 PM, LSJ GSJ < > wrote: 
Good Afternoon 

While you where on LSJ I mentioned about Sanfrans Dejour - Landscaper, whom has been with the 
company since 2014. He is a very hard worker 

He was hit with a branch on GSJ, complained of a sore head, but continued working. Arrived at work the 
following day, had a major headache, worked the day 

Went to Red Hook Family with a migraine headache, prescribed some very heavy drugs, including Valium. 
Over the course of the next week, he became worse, could not even drive let alone walk. 

I went with him and his wife to Red Hook Family, getting a referral to see a specialist, whom believed he 
was over medicated, Since detoxing all drugs, then receiving the corrected medication there has been a huge 
improvement, with the hope that he will be back at work either the end of this week or beginning next 

The point is he has used all of his sick & vacation days, would it be possible to pay him at least a week, he 
would pay LSJ back in time 
Thank you for your consideration on this matter 

Warmest regards 
Karen 

The St. James Group 
6100 Red Hook Quarter 
Suite B3 
St Thomas 
USVI 00802 
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