
From: Ann Rodriquez • 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: PRD 

Date: Mon, 12 Oct 2015 19:10:46 +0000 

Mr. Hilaire bid is for $800. 

He have to grind off all of the old Gel Coating, Sand and Re-paint with new Copper Coating. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

On Oct 10, 2015, at 2:17 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes 

On Sat, Oct 10, 2015 at 2:11 PM, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 
Carlos asked me if Uncle Kebo can Sand and Paint PRD to get it done quicker? 

Mr. Gerard Hilaire "Uncle Kebo" did the repairs on Little C. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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