
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Ann Rodriquez

Subject: Re: Omar 
Date: Wed, 07 Oct 2015 16:08:24 +0000 

Yes 

On Wed, Oct 7, 2015 at 12:06 PM, Ann Rodriquez < > wrote: 
Good afternoon Bossman, 

Omar is requesting 50% payment from both projects Heli wall and MC wall (requested amount $3,280.00)? 

Total amount for both projects: $6,560.00 
Heli wall $2,560.00 -outstanding 
MC wall $4,000.00 -outstanding 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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