
From: Ann Rodriquez
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Cc: Rich Kahn
Subject: Master Bedroom 

Date: Thu, 17 Sep 2015 17:39:13 +0000 

I'm 100% at fault. 

I have no excuse as to why it wasn't covered before Pokey started sanding. I purchased all the materials needed 
to cover the walls in July before Leighton came on board. 

Please keep all monthly Bonuses until the damage to your Bedroom wall is paid off in full. 

Anna 

On Sep 17, 2015, at 12:34 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

legithon was adamant about protecting the walls and furniture in the master bedroom, it is a total mess. will 
need to be repainted , all unccessary. 
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