From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re: ZDC HVAC Monitoring Contract
Date: Tue, 08 Sep 2015 21:45:09 +0000

try

On Tue, Sep 8, 2015 at 11:44 PM, Richard Kahn f_} wrote:

Brice would like to switch HVAC monitoring from ECI to Horizon
Annual cost savings will be approximately 2.510.00

My only concern was that Horizon has never done this work before and that Horizon 1s now Brice’s prefferred
vendor who 1s getting a lot of our work

Please advise if ok to make change
Thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fa
cel

Rich

Horizon at this time does not provide monitoring service to other clients, this would be a one service.

Please note the following:

Horizon did all building automation installation, monitoring and repair on all Chant Facilities NM from 1996 to 2005, Chant sold out to
BGK which is now Rosemont.

These Facilities included AOL, now Lowes Call center, T mobil call center, clear channel / state farm building.

At present, Horizon is contracted by Trane to install building automation and Honeywell controls systems

| hope this addresses vour concemns

thank you

On Tue, Sep 8, 2015 at 1:40 PM, Richard Kahn <[ R - ot

1 would like referrals that Hornzon currently performs HVAC monitoring on
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thank you

Begin forwarded message:

From: [N <M
Subject: ZDC HVAC Monitoring Contract
Date: September 8, 2015 at 3:37:57 PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn < >
Cc: Zorro Ranch < >
Rich

Attached Monitoring Contract for HVAC system at Zorro
As discussed

ECT's Contract for monitoring HVAC was not renewed and [ approached Horizon Mechanical to provide a new contract.

[ would like to proceed with Horizon, starting October 1st 2015, on a monthly basis, at a cost of $427.50. ECT cost was $636.65 per

manth.
Can we proceed?

Stanley, NM

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use. disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved
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