
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Larry Larry Visoski <1.le 

Cc: Je vacation <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: B727 update 
Date: Wed, 26 Aug 2015 17:29:17 +0000 

not sure cost of repairs however I just spoke with Lee and our deductible on B727 is 500,000 
please advise on cost of repairs 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 

> On Aug 25, 2015, at 10:19 PM, Larry Visoski c wrote: 

> Jeffrey 
> A2 inspection will be completed Thursday on Boeing 727. 
> Right hand trailing edge flap has dent due to plastic engine cover blowing out of #3 engine during a 
thunderstorm in Palm beach. 
> *** 

> Rich is this a possible insurance claim? I'll have pricing by Tomorrow. 
> We are currently locating trailing edge flap exchange or possible repair of our flap in Miami. Depending on 
flight schedule of Boeing? 
> We don't have to change / repair the entire flap, just trailing edge. 

> Note: 
> Larry Morrison has FAA maintenance conformity inspection scheduled for Thursday this week. It's our 6 
month records review with FAA from Orlando. 
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> Sent from my iPhone 
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