From: Larry Visoski -}
To: Je vacation <jeevacationfgmail.com=>
Ce: Rich Kahn <[ |
Subject: Fwd: N212JE SC17734 Rolls Royce Fan Balance
Date: Thu, 20 Aug 2015 01:29:10 +0000
Attachments: 5C17734 Prelim Fan Balance pdf
Inline-Images: mime-attachment. gif

For your approval
GIV fan balance

Sent from my 1Phone

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Date: August 19, 2015 at 11:40:42 AM MDT
To:
Ce: ,
Subject: Re: N212JE SC17734 Rolls Royee Fan Balance

Larry,
Please find attached the prelim for the fan balance. If you have any questions please let us know.

Thanks,

Ray Kraber
Senior Service Center Coordinator
Gulfstream

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain Personal
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any Personal
Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service providers and
may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. I you
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby naotified that you have either received this message in error or through
interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly
prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not
those of Gulfsiream Aerospace Corporation.

If you received this massage in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original
message.
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From: Larry Visoski <

Ta i £
Date: 081772015 02:56 PM

Subjact: Re: N212JE SC18034

Approved
I'll sign and scan when [ get home thanks Larry

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 17, 2015, at 2:43 PM, _ wrote:

Good Afternoon Larry,

We need to get your signature on the new work order for the paint thickness measurement. Please sign and return. If you
have any guestions please let us know.

Thanks,

Ray Kraber
Senior Service Center Coordinator
Gulfstream

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain Personal
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any Personal
Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service providers and
may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. If you
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have either received this message in error or through
interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly
prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not
those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation.

If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original
message.

From: Larry Visoski <[]} NG

Ce: ' < - .
T

Date: 0B 14/2015 11:20 AM

Subjact: Ra: Credit
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I'll do wire trfr most likely,.
I'm sure Ron beat the estimated labor, correct ?

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 14, 2015, at 11:18 AM, | NG o

Thanks Larry,
How would you like to handle the rest of the invoice? | will have a prelim to you shortly.

Thanks,

Ray Kraber
Senior Service Center Coordinator
Gulfstream

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain Personal
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any Personal
Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service providers and
may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. If you
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby naotified that you have either received this message in error or through
interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly
prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not
those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation.

If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original
message.

From:  Larry Visoski <|| | NGNGN__-
o Ray Krabar . Ron Bystrom <]} NG - - i:o Schafier

Date:  0BM42015 10:39 &AM
Subjact: Fud: Credit

Ray, Denise and Ron
Make sure to apply this $6097.05 credit to my invoice for reunion mount change

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:
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From:

Date: August 11, 2015 at 1:45:24 PM EDT
To:

Subject: Re: Credit

Good Afternoon:

Please see a statement of your account below. As of today, you have credit of $-6,097.05.

<mime-attachment.gif>1 attachment

(See arttached file: 0501 001 pdf)

Have a Great Day |

Denise Schaffer
Cradit and Customer Accounts

Gulfstream Aerospace Carioration

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient{s) and may contain Personal
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any Personal
Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service providers and
may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. If you
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have either received this message in error or through
interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly
prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not
those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation.

If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original

message.

<mime-attachment.gif>Larry Visoski ---08/11/2015 11:47:14 AM-—Hello Denise hope all is well? How much credit do |
have on my account at this time? If any atall T

<mime-attachment.gif=

Frrom:

<mime-attachment.gif=

Larry Visoski <[

<mime-attachment.gif=

a
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Denise Schaffer <

Date:

<mime-attachment.gif=

0112015 11:47 AM

Subjact:

<mime-attachment.gif=

Credit

Hells Denbise hope all is well? How smuch credit 4o I have on sy account at this evime? IF any at all
~

Jege LLC

Sent from my LPhone

[attachment "0501 001.pdf" deleted by Raymond E Kraber/WPB/GAC]

=SC18034 WA pdf=
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