From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
To: Larry Visoski <lvjet(@aol.com>
Subject: Re: Lease engine standard fees
Date: Wed, 19 Aug 2015 12:14:04 +0000

15 the event 7 the amount to change them? and nstall re install , 6 weeks looks like 250k

On Wed, Aug 19, 2015 at 1:03 AM, Larry Visoski <lvjeti@aol.com™ wrote:
I'll confirm with Kathleen and Dallas Airmotive first guess would be 4 to 6 weeks
We would keep loners installed while our engines would be repaired this would be no cost when covered under

corporate care
Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 18, 2015, at 10:37 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

how many days to rebuild engine

On Tue, Aug 18, 2015 at 9:49 PM, Larry Visoski <lvjet@aol.com> wrote:

Sent from my 1Phone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Goncalves, Kathleen" <Kathleen.Gonealvesiwrolls-royce.com=
Date: August 18, 2015 at 9:35:47 PM MDT

To: Larry Visoski <lvjet(@aol.com™

Subject: Lease engine standard fees

Hi Larry

You asked me to resend you this information. Here are the lease engine charges.

Charge per Event $13.000.75
Charge per Day $3,818.35
Hourly Charge $299.91
Cyclic Charge 5101.83
Insurance Value 3 3,000,000.00
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Best Regards,

Kathleen Goncalves

Regional Customer Manager

Rolls-Royce North America, Inc.
12365 152nd St N, Jupiter, FL 33478
Tel: 561 768 9625; Cell: 317 224 4591

Fax: 561 277 2412

Email: kathleen.goncalves@rolls-royce.com

This e-mail (including attachments) contains contents owned by Rolls-Royce ple and its subsidiaries,
affiliated companies or customers and covered by the laws of England and Wales, Brazil, US, or Canada
(federal, state or provincial). The information contained in this email 1s intended to be confidential, may
be legally privileged and subject to export controls which may restrict the access to and transfer of the

information. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any retention,

dissemination, distribution, interception or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited and may
subject you to further legal action. Reply to the sender if you received this email by accident, and then

delete the email and any attachments.
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