From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Ann Rodriquez <N
Ce: Rich Kahn <] . D:phne Wallace <[ -

Subject: Re: Wasted Plate
Date: Mon, 27 Jul 2015 13:40:44 +0000

no choice

On Mon, Jul 27, 2015 at 9:22 AM, Ann Rodriquez *’_?' wrote:

Ann R.

Begin forwarded message:

From: gene kral <
Date: July 27, 2015 at 9:09:18 AM AST

To: Ann Rodrique: < -

Subject: Wasted Plate

Reply-To: gene kral < -

Anna-

1) Cut out wasted plate under fuel tanks and behind fuel tanks, back grind, make templates for new plate fit up,
tack, weld, and dye penetrant to insure no leaks. Labor....................511,810 {Originally $14,410 but a discount
was given as per our conversation with Anna Rodriguez.)

2) Materials: 70 Sq ft of 5086 marine grade aluminum plate, cut off wheels, grinding wheels, argon gas, mig wire,
dye penetrant, and misc...................55750

Total...................... 517 800 (reduced from $20,160 as per our conversation with Anna Rodriguez)

Anna like we discussed on the phone we need to know by today on how to proceed. We are not trying to create
more work, no one would have ever known about this bad plate if the fuel tanks were not taken out to be
replaced. Thank you.......

Gene Kral Sr.

Subbase Drydock, Ine.
Parcel 162, Subbase

St Thomas, USYIODR02
TEL: (340) 776-2078
FAX: [340) 7T79-8426

please note
The information contained mn this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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